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Champion Steve Kenyon (l) is congratulated by Assoc. Manager Phil Goodman (c) and runner up Troy Stus 

 
 STEVE KENYON WINS MDUSBC SENIOR MASTERS 
AND CLAIMS $1,800 FIRST PRIZE AT INDIAN LANES 

 
Steve Kenyon of Grosse Ile won the 32nd Annual Metro Detroit USBC Senior Masters Tournament in 
defeating two-time defending champion Troy Stus of South Lyon 473-451. In claiming the title, Kenyon was 
the lone survivor in the winner’s bracket remaining undefeated until the first set of the final match and 
claimed the $1,800 first prize. Stus earned the second place check of $900.  
 
Kenyon qualified 14th with a six-game total of 1,333 and a high game of 268. In match play, he defeated 
Peter Kaczmarczyk of Warren 504-454, Stacy Keith of New Boston 504-493, Phil Zocharski of Chelsea 
469-446 and Stus in their first match, 501-457 to advance to the final match. In the final round, Kenyon lost 
the repeat match against Stus 501-424 before winning the deciding match of the two-game elimination 
format. Throughout the two days of competition, Kenyon averaged 233.78 for 18 games. 
 
Stus was positioned ninth with his defending champion automatic ninth seed. In the qualifying round he 
finished with 1,280 and a high game of 263. In match play, he defeated Brad Gray of Farmington Hills 431-
367, top qualifier Gerald Johnson of Taylor 506-493 and Gerald Sikora of Ecorse 415-343 before losing his 
first match against Kenyon. In the loser’s bracket, he defeated Johnson in their second match of the day 
473-465 setting up the rematch against Kenyon in the finals. Throughout the competition, Stus averaged 
225.70 over 20 games. 
 
Johnson was the top qualifier with 1,505 and a high game of 267. He first defeated Robert Sloma of  
Jenison 555-382 before losing to Stus in their first match. In the loser’s bracket, he defeated Keith Engling 
of Highland 465-418, Kaczmarczyk 508-440, and Sikora 444-387 before losing the rematch against Stus. 
Johnson averaged 245.45 over 20 games earning $700 for his third-place finish. 
 
During the qualifying round, two perfect 300 games were rolled by Carl Harden of Livonia (first game) and 
Stephen Krywy of Warren (third game). In the first three games of match play, Zocharski bowled 262, 290 
and 278 for an honor score series of 830. 
 
The MDUSBC Masters Tournament is a USBC certified event operated by the Metro Detroit USBC, the 
largest local association of the United States Bowling Congress which serves over 32,000 adult and youth 
bowlers in the Metropolitan Detroit market. 
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2025 MDUSBC Sr. Masters Prize List - Indian Lanes 

     

Place Name City Average Amount 

1 Steve Kenyon  Grosse Ile 233.78 $1,800.00 

2 Troy Stus  South Lyon 225.70 $900.00 

3 Gerald Johnson  Taylor 245.45 $700.00 

4 Gerald Sikora  Ecorse 224.13 $500.00 

5 Carl Harden  Livonia 217.50 $400.00 

6 Phil Zocharski Chelsea 235.14 $400.00 

7 Randy Warnken Clinton Twp 234.14 $350.00 

8 Peter Kaczmarczyk  Warren 227.14 $350.00 

9 Stacy Keith New Boston 228.00 $325.00 

10 Bruce Wright  Warren 220.67 $325.00 

11 Keith Engling Highland 214.33 $325.00 

12 Robert Sloma  Jenison 209.75 $325.00 

13 Mika Koivuniemi  Traverse City 228.50 $300.00 

14 Richard Wayne  Westland 227.30 $300.00 

15 Bradley Gray  Farmington Hills 212.90 $300.00 

16 Larry Walker  Garden City 212.90 $300.00 

     

     

 Non-Cashing Super Seniors   

1 Michael Lucente Warren  $140.00 

2 Jessie Bowersock Ann Arbor  $140.00 

3 John Langston Sr Plymouth  $140.00 

4 Glenn Ludeman Chesterfield  $140.00 

5 Gerald Kopec Sterling Heights  $140.00 

6 Michael McCleskey Southfield  $140.00 

7 Harold Sullins Chesterfield  $140.00 

8 Terence Dockery Fraser  $140.00 

9 Michael Craig Westerville  $140.00 

10 Norman Smith Sunbury  $140.00 

11 Eddie Mintz Canton  $140.00 

     

 Total   $9,440.00 
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